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Evaluation and Management Services in Interventional Pain Practice:
Doing it right!
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Proper coding and documentation for evaluation and man-
agement services continuously and progressively are be-
coming not only complicated, but also confusing.  Although
medical evaluation of patients has been a fact of life since
the beginnings of medical history, medicine has been sub-
stantially influenced by federal regulations since the enact-
ment of Medicare.  Physicians’ fear of being prosecuted is
increasing.  This is reinforced by actions of the federal gov-
ernment in multiple cases with sky-high penalties and by
the Office of the Inspector General’s target of 600,000 phy-
sicians in practice in its work plan for the new millennium.

Evaluation and management services utilization, medical ne-
cessity, and appropriate documentation for level and com-
plexity of service are extremely important components of
evaluation and management services.  Similarly, differentiat-
ing between a consult versus a visit is also crucial to avoid
upcoding, or in a worst-case scenario, downcoding.  While

the history is the same for all types of visits except for the
complexity for each level, four types of physical examina-
tion are available, either in a general multisystem examina-
tion or a single-system examination.  However, the com-
plexity of medical decision making is the essential factor in
deciding to which level the evaluation and management be-
long.

This review will discuss various aspects of evaluation and
management guidelines in interventional practice and also
guide the physician in performing these evaluations in an
appropriate manner with proper documentation, thus avoid-
ing the pitfalls of fraud and abuse.

Keywords:  Evaluation and management services, interven-
tional pain practice, history, physical examination, medical
decision making

Over the last few years there has been significant confu-
sion over the proper coding and documentation for evalu-
ation and management services in general and
interventional pain management in particular.  The confu-
sion has been made worse by numerous articles published
in a multitude of advisory publications and misguided ad-
vice by well-meaning consultants (1).  Interventional pain
physicians have learned basic evaluation of patients pre-
senting with pain based on their speciality training.  While
modern training programs are now introducing residents
and fellows to the intricacies of evaluation and manage-
ment services and federal regulations, this has not always
been the case.  In a 1999 tutorial in Pain Digest entitled
“History Taking – Examination and Management of Low
Back Pain,” the authors provided techniques of history
taking, physical examination, psychological assessment,

imaging in low back pain, special neurological testing,
pain-producing structures in low back pain, diagnosis of
pain syndromes, and rationale for management and avail-
able modalities (2).  Similarly, multiple textbooks of pain
management, physiatry, and neurology have described the
evaluation of pain patients (3-7).  While these publications
were written by well-meaning, well-read academicians, it is
unfortunate that none of them meets evaluation and man-
agement documentation criteria according to the level of
service established by the Health Care Financing Admin-
istration (HCFA).

HISTORICAL  CONSIDERATIONS

The medical evaluation of patients has been a fact of life
since the beginnings of medical history.  Over the years,
advances in medicine, increasing knowledge, and under-
standing of the physiologic concepts of pain have dra-
matically improved the evaluation process.  While medi-
cine was always influenced by federal regulations, the in-
fluence of laws and regulations has become much more
intrusive since the enactment of Medicare.  In the evolu-
tion of numerous regulations governing the practice of
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medicine by HCFA, implementation of evaluation and man-
agement guidelines started in the 1990s.  The latest guide-
lines by HCFA were developed in 1997.  The new proposed
guidelines are awaiting pilot testing and are expected to be
released in the later part of this year or early next year.
Consequently, HCFA has permitted providers to use either
the 1997 or 1995 versions of the guidelines (8).

APPROPRIATE   DOCUMENTATION

Never in U.S. history has there been such an emphasis
placed on the description and definition of what the physi-
cian does for and to the patient (9).  Compliance with laws
and regulations encompassing documentation, medical
records, coding, billing, collections, contracts, auditing,
and other areas is of crucial importance in the practice of
interventional pain medicine.  The Balanced Budget Act of
1997; The Kennedy-Kassebaum Reform Bill of 1996; The
Budget Reconciliation Act of 1997; the National Correct

Coding Policy of 1996; the goal of HCFA to reduce im-
proper payment rate to 5% or lower by fiscal year 2002,
from 8% during fiscal year 1999; and President Clinton’s
proposal for fiscal year 2001 budget, with a multitude of
initiatives to fight Medicare waste, fraud, and abuse, not
only indicate the importance of regulatory influence, but
also are influencing physician practices.

In the past, physicians followed a simple format character-
ized by an acronym, SOAP, which stands for subjective,
objective, assessment, and plan.  This was later expanded,
presumably to meet the criteria of HCFA’s evaluation and
management services, to SOAPER to also include educa-
tion and return instructions.  Other variations of the same
theme include SOAPIE, which stands for subjective, ob-
jective, assessment, plan, intervention and evaluation; and
SNOCAMP, which stands for subjective, nature of pre-
senting problem, counseling, assessment, medical deci-
sion making and plan.  However, due to the complicated
nature of the documentation guidelines proposed by HCFA,
SOAP and SOAPER no longer meet the criteria in most
cases.  Other variations are as complicated as HCFA guide-
lines.  The HCFA and American Medical Association, as
well as other speciality societies, continue to struggle with
differing opinions, and contentiously argue in favor of and
against the various components of evaluation and man-
agement guidelines.

The most important aspect of billing and coding for evalu-
ation and management services includes appropriate docu-
mentation of the level of service by documentation of his-
tory, which includes chief complaint, history of present
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illness, review of systems, and past, family, and social
history; physical examination, which includes either
single-system or multisystem examination; and complex-
ity of decision making, which includes straightforward,
low complexity, moderate complexity, or high complex-
ity.

Importance of Documentation

The HCFA reported losses of $12.6 billion in 1998, and
$13.5 billion in 1999 in improper billing and overpayments
to providers.  Around the same time, the Office of the In-
spector General (OIG) released a report that showed a mas-

sive war on health fraud.  As shown in Fig. 1, 22% of the
total health-care overpayments were attributed to physi-
cian practices in 1999.  The OIG also estimated that more
than half of rehab payments in 1997-1998 fiscal year were
improper:  either medically not necessary, poorly docu-
mented, or not provided by licensed personnel.  Along the
same lines, HCFA also reported that it has recouped ap-
proximately $1.2 billion in the first half of fiscal year 1999
from part B prepayment audits alone from ambulatory sur-
gery centers, hospital outpatient departments, physician
claims, and durable medical equipment, among others.

Interventional pain medicine is considered as a high-risk

epyTnoitcnaS
foelpmaS

ylhtnoM
snoisulcxE

latoT
snoisulcxE

ronoitacoveresneciL
noisnepsus

371 584,5

detaler-margorP
noitcivnoc

56 304.5

dnaesubatneitaP
tcelgen

24 852,2

htlaehnotluafeD
naolnoitacude

32 010,2

-laudividnidenoitcnaS
ytitnedenwo

6 026

latoT 903 677,51

leveL
fo

tisiV

epyT
fo

tisiV

weN
tneitaP

eciffO
tisiV

dehsilbatsE
)s(tneitaptuO

eciffO
stlusnoC

roweN
dehsilbatsE
)s(tneitaP

laitinI
weNtneitapnI
dehsilbatsEro

)s(tneitaP

tneuqesbuS
eraClatipsoH

laitinI
tneitapnI
tlusnoC

pu-wolloF
tneitapnI
tlusnoC

1 melborP
desucof

10299 21299 14299 AN AN 15299 AN

2 dednapxE
desucofmelborp

20299 31299 24299 AN AN 25299 AN

3 wol/deliateD
ytixelpmoc

30299 41299 34299 12299 13299 35299 16299

4 /evisneherpmoC
etaredom
ytixelpmoc

40299 51299 44299 22299 23299 45299 26299

5 /evisneherpmoC
ytixelpmochgih

50299 AN 54299 32299 33299 55299 36299

Fig 2. Medicare fee-for-service (FFS) error
          rates

* projected

�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������

�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������

�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������

������������
������������
������������
������������
������������
������������
������������

�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������

�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������
�����������

14%

11%

7%
8%

6%
5%

1996 1997 1998 1999 2000 2001

Er
ro

r R
at

e

*
*

Table 3.  Sanctions of medical providers

Table 4.  Various types of CPT codes utilized for evaluation and management services
relevant to pain management



Pain Physician Vol. 3, No. 3, 2000

Manchikanti • E/M Services 325

area next only to psychiatry and podiatry.  Interventional
pain medicine generally is a high-profile, high-volume,
high-dollar practice that also includes physical therapy
and psychological services.  Thus, the consequences of
incomplete or inaccurate coding, as shown in Table 1, are
disastrous not only for medicine in general, but specifi-
cally for interventional pain medicine practices (8-10).
This is confirmed by the large number of exclusions and
sanctions of medical providers each month, with total
exclusions amounting to 5,175 and total sanctions of
medical providers amounting to 15,776 in 1999 (Tables
2 and 3).  The HCFA also stated that its goal is to reduce
the improper payment rate to 5% or lower by fiscal year

2002, from 8% in fiscal year 1999 (Fig. 2).  In addition,
HCFA intends to reduce the fee-for-service rate to 6%
by October 2000.  The HCFA, as well as President Clinton,
has proposed multiple initiatives to fight Medicare waste,
fraud, and abuse (11).

Impact on Physician Practices

In a recent survey by the Association of Medical Physi-
cians and Surgeons, physicians expressed their concerns
that the stepped-up threats of prosecution of doctors and
government red tape may make it harder for Medicare ben-
eficiaries to find doctors to treat them (11).  According to
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this survey, 82% of physicians reported an increased fear
of prosecution or investigation during the past three years;
and 71% reported making changes in their practice to avoid
the threat of prosecution, including restricting services.  It
is interesting to note that 66% of physicians plan to retire
from patient care at an earlier age than they would have
considered 5 years ago, 23% of the responding physicians
have stopped accepting Medicare patients, and 34% of
the responding physicians reported having difficulty find-
ing physicians who would accept their Medicare patients
for consultations.

Physicians’ fear of being prosecuted is not paranoia.  The
federal government is seeking as much as $37 million from

a physician for allegedly overbilling by upcoding, surpris-
ingly in general practice (12).  This physician’s charges are
allegedly out of the norm for her specialty, with her coding
consisting of only 7% of level 3, but 49% of level 4, and
26% of level 5 (12).  Similarly, an anesthesia group settled
for $3.2 million for insufficient supervision; an ophthal-
mologist settled for $8.5 million for upcoding; and an emer-
gency physician group settled for $15 million for upcoding.
In addition, the OIG in its 1999 work plan is targeting
600,000+ physicians in practice.

EVALUATION  AND  MANAGEMENT  SERVICES

Fig 3. Comparison of 1998 E/M utilization
data - new patient office visits
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- established patient office visits
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Table 7.  Utilization for year 1998, for all new and established patient office consultations,
and speciality practices of anesthesiology, physiatry, and neurology
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Utilization Statistics

Table 4 shows CPT codes for all types of visits relevant to
pain management.  These do not include critical care and
emergency department visits.  As shown in Table 5, all
Medicare new-patient visits total 11, 295,486.  Of these,
89,066 were by anesthesiologists; 85, 364 were by
physiatrists; and 94,056 were by neurologists.  While the
majority of anesthesiology visits may represent pain man-
agement, only a portion of physiatry and neurology visits
constitute pain management.  Similarly, as shown in Table
6, all established patient visits amounted to 165,009,774.

Of these, 575, 886 were by anesthesiologists; 646, 668 were
by physiatrists; and 2, 567,315 were by neurologists for
1998.  Office consultations exceeded a total of 9,000,000; of
which 152,515 were by anesthesiologists; 117,351 were by
physiatrists; and 698,621 were by neurologists (Table 7).
There were also a significant number of visits involving
initial inpatient visits, and hospital consults.  These are
illustrated in Tables 8 and 9; however, these do not include
nursing home visits and emergency department visits.

As shown in Fig. 3, a bell-shaped curve is obtained for all
new patient visits.  This was also true for anesthesiology
and physiatry, whereas neurology failed to conform to a
bell-shaped curve.  This may be due to neurologists’ see-
ing many patients with neurological disorders requiring
higher levels of services.  Similarly, as shown in Fig. 4,
established  patient visits conform to a bell-shaped curve
when plotted for all specialties combined.  In addition, a
bell-shaped curve was also obtained for all specialties in-
cluding anesthesiology, physiatry, and neurology.

Fig. 5 shows the rate of utilization of new-office patient
visits versus office consultations in anesthesiology prac-
tices, which mostly constitutes pain management.  Such
differentiation emphasizing pain management was not fea-
sible for either physiatry or neurology.  The OIG believes
that evaluation and management coding is the area of great-
est exposure for physicians and medical practices.  The
documentation criteria for correct coding of these stan-
dard office visits are extensive.  Several of the OIG risk

Fig 5. Comparison utilization of evaluation
codes by anesthesiologists in 1998 for
various levels of services - new patients
office visit vs. consultation
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Table 8.  Utilization of initial inpatient and subsequent hospital care visits for 1998, for all
specialties; and specialty practices of anesthesiology, physiatry, and neurology
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areas fall into the coding category.  They include upcoding
(billing at a higher code than what is documented in the
medical record); billing for services rendered by
nonphysicians (the nurse visit office code, 99211, is one of
the most misused codes, according to the OIG); medical
necessity (in many cases physician notes will not clearly
state the medical necessity for the services rendered); and
misrepresenting diagnosis to justify services (assigning a
diagnosis to meet a specific code level is a way in which
some physicians have “gamed” the Medicare system in
the past).  Physicians recognize the difficulty involved in
good documentation and correct coding.  However, it has
been noted that undercoding is as much a problem as
overcoding.  Undercoding puts the practice at risk of los-
ing money following defensive coding.  In addition,
undercoding also sends up a red flag at HCFA, just like
overcoding.  Investigators assume that if the physician is
incorrectly coding in one direction, it is quite possible that
the same physician may be coding incorrectly in another
direction by upcoding others.  With more than 132,000
pages of complex federal regulations covering the Medi-
care program, the IRS, with 17,000 pages of regulations,
appears much simpler and friendlier.  However, unfortu-
nately, physicians do not have to deal with the IRS on a
daily basis, whereas they have to deal with Medicare in an
active practice.  The OIG claims that improper documenta-
tion, and lack of medical necessity account for 70% of bad
claims.

The HCFA announced that it plans to adopt a policy that
will address undercoding by physicians who bill Medi-
care, along with upcoding.  The HCFA has proposed defi-
nitions for minor, intermediate, and major error levels by
the percent of errors discovered in an audit.  Fewer than
5% errors constitutes the lowest level of concern, which
could invite the carrier to remove the practice from edit
sweeps.  However, if billing error rate tops 36%, it is an
indication of impending trouble (13).  The error rates now
range from below 5% to above 51% of claims.  Undercoding
is defined as a claim that has supporting documentation to
justify a higher level of service than was billed.  The HCFA’s
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attention to undercoding is apparently in response to bit-
ter complaints of physicians, who claim that carriers are
supposed to pay correctly, whether claims are upcoded
or undercoded (13).  Detection of undercoding during a
prepayment audit by carriers will result in the sending of
information to the practice that it can appeal the claim to
get paid for the higher CPT code.  If undercoding is de-
tected during a postpayment audit, carriers will “net out”
the payments; however, this policy appears to be more
harmful than beneficial to providers, as it may trigger in-
creased levels of audit activity.

Medical Necessity

Medical necessity requires appropriate diagnosis and cod-
ing by ICD-9-CM to justify services rendered and indicate
the severity of the patient’s condition (14).  The Balanced
Budget Act (HR 2015, Section 4317) requires all physi-
cians to provide the diagnostic information for all Medi-
care/Medicaid patients starting from January 1, 1998 (10).
Further, failure to comply with this regulation can result in
prosecution.  Physicians should code by listing the ICD-9-
CM diagnostic codes shown in the medical record to be
chiefly responsible for the services provided.  Coding
should be to the highest degree of certainty for each en-
counter.  Coding also should correlate with multiple com-

ponents of the patient’s medical record, including initial
evaluation or follow-up visits, and billing statement.  One
“silver lining” for interventional pain practices is that
chronic conditions treated on an ongoing basis may be
reported as many times as the patient receives care for
the condition.  If proper diagnosis is not established, codes
that describe symptoms and signs, as opposed to the diag-
nosis, are acceptable for reporting purposes until the diag-
nosis is confirmed.

Medical Record

A medical record is a document with confidential informa-
tion that functions as a clinical record, as well as a busi-
ness record (Table 10).  A properly executed medical record
facilitates and provides information with regards to:

♦ Why did the patient present for care?
♦ What was done?
♦ Where were the services rendered?
♦ When is the patient to return or what is the plan

of action?
♦ Will there be follow-up tests or procedures

ordered?
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Levels of Service

Evaluation and management services in pain management
are office outpatient services and hospital inpatient ser-
vices (Table 4).  Five levels of services are available for
office outpatients, four levels for established office out-
patients (comprehensive/high complexity not available),
and five levels for consultations and new patient visits
that include:

Level 1 – Problem focused,
Level 2 – Expanded problem focused,
Level 3 – Detailed/low complexity,
Level 4 – Comprehensive/moderate complexity,

and
Level 5 – Comprehensive/high complexity.

Hospital services include initial inpatient, either new or
established patients; subsequent hospital care; initial in-
patient consultations; and follow-up inpatient consulta-
tions (Table 4).  Initial inpatient and subsequent hospital
care is divided into three levels encompassing:

Level 1 – Detailed/low complexity,
Level 2 – Comprehensive/moderate complexity,

and
Level 3 – Comprehensive/high complexity.

Initial and follow-up inpatient consultations, however, dif-
fer in that initial inpatient consultations are at five levels
similar to new patient consultations but follow-up inpa-
tient consultations are only at three levels.

The descriptors for the levels of evaluation and manage-
ment services recognize seven components, of which three
components are considered crucial in defining the levels
of evaluation and management services in interventional
pain management.  Three crucial components are:

♦ History,
♦ Physical examination, and
♦ Medical decision making.

Other components include:

♦ Counseling,
♦ Coordination of care,
♦ Nature of presenting problem, and
♦ Time.

Because the level of evaluation in management service is
dependent on two or three components, performance and

documentation of one component at the highest level does
not necessarily mean that the encounter in its entirety quali-
fies for the highest level of evaluation and management
service.

If counseling or coordination of care is provided as the
predominant service constituting more than 50% of the
time by the physician, then time may be considered the key
or controlling factor to qualify for a particular level of evalu-
ation and management service.

Consult Versus Visit

Interpretation of the guidelines for consultations versus
visits and billing for these services, along with the level of
service, are contentious issues.  Recent guidelines by HCFA
have clarified some of the issues involved in the confusion
with regards to this issue (Table 11).  The guidelines sug-
gest that any time a physician sees a patient at the request
of another physician, the visit may be a consultation (1).
However, there are four considerations for the visit to
qualify for a consultation.

♦ First, the requesting physician must be seeking
the advice of the consulting physician, not trans-
ferring care.

♦ Second, there must be documentation in the
patient’s record of the request for a consultation.

♦ Third, the level of service must be documented in
the patient’s record.

♦ Fourth and last, there must be documentation that
the consulting physician has communicated his
or her findings to the requesting physician in writ-
ing.

Table 11 shows the differences between a consultation
and visit.  The CPT and HCFA guidelines have always
stated that a physician may order laboratory tests and/or
institute treatment at the time of a consultation.  Hence, if
an interventional medicine physician is asked to see a pa-
tient with back pain, either in the hospital or in the office,
the interventional pain specialist may institute treatment
and the visit may still be a consultation; however, it be-
comes a visit if the referring physician arranges for the
receiving physician to take over part or all of the care prior
to the receiving physician is 000seeing the patient.  An-
other misunderstood issue with regards to consultation is
that if the receiving physician assumes part or all of the
care of the patient, then subsequent visits must not be
coded as a consultation but as subsequent outpatient or
hospital care.  This is somewhat confused with initial visits
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in some cases.  Follow-up consultations would be appro-
priate only when there is a period of time between visits.
For example, if an interventional pain physician saw a pa-
tient in consultation, made recommendations and signed
off and then would be asked to see the patient because the
treatment did not work, that might be follow-up consulta-
tion.  One of the major requirements of consultation is that
of documentation in the patient’s record that consultation
in fact was requested.  This can be accomplished by a
letter from the requesting physician asking for the consul-
tation, or a consultation request slip followed by docu-
mentation by the consulting physician with something simi-
lar to:  “I was asked to see this patient in consultation by
Dr. Smith.”  Documentation that findings of the consulting
physician were communicated in writing to the requesting
physician is also crucial.  This is also accomplished by
sending the requesting physician a copy of the patient
record, and a thank-you letter.  Unfortunately, recently pub-
lished guidelines require that it be in writing, contradicting
the earlier guidelines where communication by telephone
was sufficient.  Coding for a large number of consultations
raises red flags for HCFA medical directors who are moni-
toring each physician’s coding profile.  Thus, abnormal
coding profiles are likely to bring on audits; and, therefore,
interventional pain medicine specialists must weigh the
increased revenue from a consultation versus the possible
consequences of audit, which may include not only evalu-
ation and management services, but may also be extended
to any other area of the practice.

PROCESS  OF  EVALUATION

History

History constitutes one of the three crucial components of
evaluation and management, the other two being physical
examination and medical decision making.  All patients,
whether new or established, seen in the office or in the
hospital setting, for visits or consultation, require docu-
mentation of history based on level of service.  The history
includes:

♦ Chief complaint,
♦ History of present illness,
♦ Review of systems, and
♦ Past, family, and/or social history.

The extent of history obtained and documented is depen-
dent upon the clinical judgment of the physician and the
nature of the presenting problem of the patient.  Neverthe-
less, the required documentation is progressively detailed

and complex, with brief and problem pertinent for problem
focused and extended problem focused to extended and
complete for detailed comprehensive and comprehensive/
complex services.

Chief Complaint:  The chief complaint is a concise state-
ment describing the symptom, problem, condition, diagno-
sis, physician-recommended return, or other factor that is
the reason for the encounter, usually stated in the patient’s
words.  This should be clearly documented in the medical
record.

The chief complaint should always be the first thing in
initial evaluation, history and physical, progress note, and
consultation report.  Examples of chief complaint or state-
ment include:

♦ Low back pain,
♦ Pain in the neck,
♦ Headache,
♦ Inability to move shoulder
♦ Pain for the past week,
♦ Pain in the spine,
♦ Management of back pain,
♦ Back that still hurts,
♦ Follow-up for back pain,
♦ Head that still hurts,
♦ Inability to walk,
♦ Reason for appointment: evaluation and

management, and
♦ Here for injection therapy.

However, chief statements such as

♦ Doing fine,
♦ Have no problems,
♦ Feeling fine,
♦ Have a history of back pain,
♦ Blocks helped, and
♦ Can’t work, etc.,
will not suffice.  It is critical that the chief complaint estab-
lishes medical necessity.

However, if medical necessity of the visit is not estab-
lished with the chief complaint, this can be established in
the history of present illness by a statement to explain the
purpose of the patient’s visit, such as:

♦ Mr. Jones is here for further evaluation and man-
agement with injection therapy, or

♦ Mr. Jones is here for further evaluation and pre-
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scription refills.

History of Present Illness:  History of present illness is a
chronological description of the development of the
patient’s present illness from the first sign and/or symp-
tom or from the previous encounter to the present.  It in-
cludes the following elements:

♦ Location – describing the area of the body;
♦ Quality – sensation or pattern that will be satis-

fied by the McGill Pain Questionnaire, either short
form or long form;

♦ Severity – satisfied by pain-rating scale, either
visual analog scale or numerical scale describing
the level of pain;

♦ Duration – symptom duration from onset to the
present  encounter;

♦ Timing – description of the pain pattern: continu-
ous, intermittent, in the evening or afternoon, etc.;

♦ Context – specific circumstances, conditions, and
activities surrounding the present condition;

♦ Modifying factors – measures taken to relieve
symptoms or discomfort, such as physical
therapy, surgery, injection therapy, drug therapy,
etc., and results with these measures; and

♦ Associated signs and symptoms – such as numb-
ness, weakness, blurred vision, disturbed sleep
pattern, or difficulty with activities of daily living,
etc.

Brief and extended history of present illness is distin-
guished by the amount of detail needed to accurately char-
acterize the clinical problem(s) (8, 10).  Brief history of
present illness requires documentation of one to three ele-
ments of the present illness, whereas extended history of
present illness requires documentation of at least four ele-
ments of the history of present illness or the status of at
least three chronic or inactive conditions.  Further, a brief
history of present illness suffices for problem-focused and
expanded-problem-focused visits, whereas extended with
at least four elements or status of three inactive or chronic
conditions is required for detailed comprehensive and com-
prehensive complex levels of services (8, 10).  Examples of
brief history of present illness with one to three elements
include:

♦ Severe low back pain with radiation into leg,
♦ Severe neck pain with headache and radiation to

both upper extremities, and
♦ Throbbing headache for 2 months.

Examples of extended history of present illness with four
elements or status of three chronic or inactive elements
may be achieved with careful articulation of patient symp-
tomatology with one or more conditions; for example, in-
termittent, severe low back pain with radiation into left
lower extremity, associated with occasional numbness, tin-
gling, and weakness, since 1978, which started following a
fall from the roof.

Review of Systems:  Review of systems is an inventory of
body systems obtained through a series of questions seek-
ing to identify signs and/or symptoms that the patient may
be experiencing or has experienced (8, 10).  Guidelines rec-
ognize the following 14 systems for purposes of review of
systems, also known as medical review.  These systems
include:

♦ Constitutional;
♦ Eyes;
♦ Ears, nose, mouth, throat;
♦ Cardiovascular;
♦ Respiratory;
♦ Gastrointestinal;
♦ Genitourinary;
♦ Musculoskeletal;
♦ Integumentary (skin and/or breast);
♦ Neurological;
♦ Psychiatric;
♦ Endocrine;
♦ Hematologic/lymphatic; and
♦ Allergy/immunologic.

Review of systems is described at three levels, which in-
clude problem pertinent, extended, and complete.  Problem
pertinent involves the documentation of the patient’s per-
tinent responses, both positive as well as negative, for the
system related to the problem.  In contrast, an extended
review of systems includes positive and pertinent nega-
tives for two to nine systems, as listed above.  For com-
plete review of systems, at least 10 systems must be re-
viewed and documented; however, while those systems
with positive or pertinent negative responses must be in-
dividually documented, a notation indicating that the re-
maining systems are negative is acceptable.  In the ab-
sence of such a notation, at least 10 systems must be indi-
vidually documented.

Review of systems is not required for problem-focused
visits, either for new patients or established patients.  For
the expanded problem-focused level, problem-pertinent re-
view of system with positives and negatives is required.
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However, for detailed, ie, level 3, for new patients as well as
established patients, extended review of systems with posi-
tive and pertinent negatives for two to nine systems is
required.  For comprehensive levels, complete review of
systems with at least 10 systems is required.

Information for review of systems is obtained through a
series of questions, either by a questionnaire or through
recording by ancillary staff.  However, physicians should
document that the information was reviewed.  Hence, there
must be notation supplementing or confirming the infor-
mation recorded by others.  If the physician is unable to
obtain a history from the patient or other source, the record
should describe the patient’s condition or other circum-
stance that precludes obtaining a history.

Review of systems may be listed as separate elements of
the history, or they may be included in the description of
the history of present illness.

A review of history obtained during an earlier encounter
does not need to be rerecorded if there is evidence that the
physician reviewed and updated the previous information.
This may occur when a physician updates his or her own
record or when many physicians use a common record in

an institutional setting or group practice.  The review and
update may be documented by:

♦ Describing any new information or noting that
there has been no change in the information; and

♦ Noting the date and location of the earlier review
of system documentation.

Appropriate levels of system reviews can be met by using
a comprehensive questionnaire enabling the patient or the
ancillary staff to record all the systems; thus, during the
documentation pertinent positives and negatives and all
positives may be recorded, followed by a statement that all
other systems were negative.

Past, Family, and/or Social History:  The past, family, and/
or social history consists of:

♦ A review of the past history of the patient
including past experiences, illnesses, operations,
injuries, and treatments;

♦ Family history, including a review of medical
events in the patient’s family, hereditary diseases,
and other factors; and

♦ Social history appropriate for age reflecting past
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Table 12.  Illustration of HCFA requirments for various levels of service
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Family history includes history of pain problems in the
family such as low back pain, neck pain, mid back or upper
back pain, chest wall pain, extremity pain, headaches, mi-
graine, arthritis, fibromyalgia, multiple sclerosis, and sys-
temic lupus erythematosus; drug dependency, alcoholism,
or drug abuse; and psychological disorders such as de-
pression, anxiety, schizophrenia, and suicidal tendencies,
etc.

Social history includes environmental information, educa-
tion, marital status, children, habits, hobbies, and occupa-
tional history, whenever available.

An example of documentation of past history is as follows:
Mr. Jones suffered with low back pain in the past, and
sustained a work-related injury in 1995, which resulted in
neck pain.  He was involved in a motor vehicle injury in
1984.  He denied any history of any other pain problems,
injuries, fibromyalgia, or arthritis.

An example of documentation of family history includes
that the history was positive for migraine, arthritis, and low
back pain in the family; but that it was negative for
fibromyalgia, systemic lupus erythematosus, alcoholism,
drug dependency, depression, schizophrenia, and epilepsy.

Social history may be documented as follows: lives in any
town, is a high school graduate, is married with three chil-
dren, works as a carpenter, has smoked three packs of ciga-
rettes since 1978, does not drink alcohol, and plays golf for
recreation.  All of these may be separated into various
sections  indicating environment, occupation, habits, and
hobbies.

Physical Examination

Various levels of evaluation and management services are
based on four types of examination.  However, the type of
examination is dependent upon the nature of the present-
ing problem(s) and clinical judgment of the physician.

♦ Problem focused – It is a limited examination of
the affected body area or organ system(s), in-
cluding examination of one to five bullet-point
elements from a single-system examination such
as musculoskeletal.

♦ Expanded problem focused – This examination
involves:

• A limited examination of the affected

and current activities.

There are two levels of past, family, and/or social history:
pertinent to problems identified in history of present ill-
ness; and complete, which includes at least one specific
history of present illness item from three of the three his-
tory areas.  A problem-focused or expanded problem-fo-
cused visit does not require past, family, and/or social
history; however, a detailed visit requires at least one spe-
cific item from one of three areas of the history to be
pertinent, in contrast to comprehensive, which requires
complete past, family, and/or social history with at least
one specific history of present illness from three of the
three history areas for new patients and at least two spe-
cific items from three history areas for established pa-
tients.

Past, family, and/or social history may be listed as a sepa-
rate element of the history, or it may be included in the
description of the history of the present illness; it may be
recorded by ancillary staff or on a questionnaire or a form
completed by the patient. To document that a physician, in
fact, reviewed the information, there must be notation
supplementing or confirming the information recorded by
others.

If the physician is unable to obtain a history from the pa-
tient or other source, the record should describe the
patient’s condition or other circumstance which precludes
obtaining a history.

Past, family, and/or social history obtained during an ear-
lier encounter does not need to be rerecorded if there is
evidence that the physician reviewed and updated the pre-
vious information.  This may occur when a physician up-
dates his or her own record or when many physicians use
a common record in an institutional setting or group prac-
tice.  The review and update may be documented by de-
scribing any new information or noting there has been no
change in the information and noting the date and location
of the earlier past, family, and/or social history.

Past history in interventional pain medicine includes his-
tory of past pain problems, ranging from headaches to
numbness or tingling in the feet, motor vehicle injuries,
Workman’s Compensation injuries, or nonoccupational in-
juries; history of headache, neck pain, upper-extremity pain,
pain in the upper, or mid back or chest wall, pain in the
lower back or lower extremities, and pain in joints; and
disorders such as arthritis, fibromyalgia, or systemic lupus
erythematosus.
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body area or organ system, and
• Any other symptomatic or related body

areas or organ systems, with documen-
tation of at least six of the bullet-point
elements from one of the 10 single-or-
gan system examinations.

♦ Detailed – This is an extended examination of the
affected body area(s) or organ system(s) and any
other symptomatic or related body area(s) or  or-
gan system(s), with documentation of at least 12
bullet points or elements from one of the 10 single-
system examinations.

♦ Comprehensive – This is a general multisystem
examination, a complete examination of a single
organ system and other symptomatic or related
areas or organ systems, with documentation of
all elements identified by a bullet.

Various types of examinations include either general multi-
system examination or single-organ-system examination.
Single-organ-system examinations include examination of
any of the 10 organ systems:

♦ Musculoskeletal;
♦ Neurological;
♦ Cardiovascular;
♦ Ears, nose, mouth, and throat;
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♦ Eyes;
♦ Genitourinary – female;
♦ Genitourinary – male;
♦ Hematologic/lymphatic/immunologic;
♦ Psychiatric;
♦ Respiratory; and
♦ Skin.

A general multisystem examination or a single-organ-sys-
tem examination may be performed by any physician, re-
gardless of the speciality.  The type of the examination,
however, whether it is general multisystem or single-or-
gan-system and its content(s) is selected by the examining
or consulting physician and based upon clinical judgment,
the patient’s history, and the nature of the presenting prob-
lem or problems(s).

In interventional pain management, the following types of
examinations are suitable.

♦ General multisystem examination,
♦ A single-organ system examination consisting of

musculoskeletal or neurological systems.

However, other systems including psychiatric may be uti-
lized if necessary.  The content in documentation require-
ments for each type and level of examination is summarized
and described in Tables 12 and 13.  Some of the  important

Table 13.  Comparison of musculoskeletal and neurological - single-system examinations for
interventional pain practice, with general multisystem - physical examination
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aspects of the evaluation and management and physical
examination are as follows:

♦ Performance and documentation of one compo-
nent at the highest level does not necessarily mean
that the encounter in its entirety qualifies for the
highest level of service.

♦ The three key components are history, examina-
tion, and complexity of medical decision making.

♦ The chief complaint, review of systems, and past,
family, or social history may be listed as separate
elements of history; or they may be included in
the description of the history of the present ill-
ness.

♦ The review of systems and the past, family, and
social history may be recorded by ancillary staff
or on a form completed by the patient.  However,
the physician must document that the informa-
tion was reviewed by making a notation supple-
menting or confirming the information recorded
by others.  If the history is unobtainable, either
from the patient or other source, the record should
describe the patient’s condition or other circum-
stance, which precludes obtaining a  history.

♦ “Abnormal” – A notation without elaboration is
insufficient.  Specific abnormal and relevant
findings of the examination of the affected or
symptomatic body area or areas or organ system
or systems should be documented.

♦ Abnormal or unexpected findings of the examina-
tion of any asymptomatic body area or areas or
organ system or organ systems should be de-
scribed.

♦ “Negative” or “normal” is sufficient to document
normal findings related to unaffected area or ar-

eas of asymptomatic organ system (s).
♦ Documentation for each element must satisfy any

numeric requirements.

General Multisystem Examinations

General multisystem examination(s), although they appear
simpler and may fit universal needs, are somewhat com-
plex.  To qualify for a given level of multisystem examina-
tion, the documentation should include:

♦ Problem-focused examination – Should include
performance and documentation of one to five
elements in one or more organ system(s) or body
area(s);

♦ Expanded problem focused – Should include per-
formance and documentation of at least six ele-
ments in one or more organ system(s) or body
area(s);

♦ Detailed examination – Should include at least six
organ systems or body areas for each system/
area selected; performance and documentation
of at least two elements is expected; however,
alternatively, a detailed examination may include
performance and documentation of at least 12 el-
ements in two or more organ systems or body
areas;

♦ Comprehensive – Comprehensive examinations
should include at least nine organ systems or
body areas; for each system/area selected, all el-
ements of the examination should be performed
unless specific directions limit the content of the
examination;  for each area or system, documen-
tation of at least two elements identified by a bul-
let is expected.

Even though criteria can be met by examining each area or
system and documenting at least two elements, the diffi-
culties with general multisystem examination include:

♦ Ophthalmoscopic examination of the optic discs
and posterior segments,

♦ Otoscopic examination of the external auditory
canals and tympanic membranes,

♦ Inspection and palpation of breasts, and
♦ Examination of the genitourinary system.

However, comprehensive examination can be met by ex-
amination of only 9 out of 12 organ systems or body areas.

Single-Organ-System Examination(s)
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Table 14. Progression of elements required for each
level of medical decision making
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Single-organ-system examination(s) include an examina-
tion of any of the 12 systems.  However, variations among
these examinations in the organ systems and body areas
reflect differing emphasis among specialties.  To qualify
for a given level of single-organ-system examination, the
following content and documentation requirements should
be met.

♦ Problem-focused – This examination should
include  performance and documentation of one
to five elements.

♦ Expanded problem-focused – This examination
should include performance and documentation
of at least six elements.

♦ Detailed examination – Examinations other than
the eye and psychiatric examination should in-
clude performance and documentation of at least
12 elements.

♦ Eye and psychiatric examination – Examinations
should include the performance and documenta-
tion of at least nine elements.

♦ Comprehensive – This examination should include
documentation of all elements.

Musculoskeletal Examination:  Musculoskeletal examina-
tion includes the musculoskeletal system as the single pri-
mary organ system and multiple other systems.  Various
systems capable of contributing a number of elements to
the evaluation in musculoskeletal examination, single sys-
tem, are as follows:

 - Two elements:
♦ Measurement of any three of the seven

vital signs, and
♦ General appearance of the patient.

  - One element:
♦ Examination of the peripheral/vascular

system.
         - One element:
♦ Palpation of lymph nodes.

              - One element:
♦ Inspection and palpation of the skin in

subcutaneous tissue.
 - Four elements:

♦ Test coordination;
♦ Deep tendon reflexes;
♦ Sensation;
♦ Assessment of mental status –orienta-

tion to time, place, and person; and
♦ Mood and effect.

    - Five elements:
♦ Gait and station;
♦ Inspection, percussion, and palpation;
♦ Range of motion;
♦ Assessment of stability; and
♦ Muscle strength and tone.

Thus, the musculoskeletal system has, potentially, a total
of 15 elements; 12 from shaded, bordered systems; and 3
from unshaded bordered systems.  The problem-focused
examination may be satisfied by examining only the mus-
culoskeletal system.  However, expanded problem-focused
examination requires at least six elements that will require
complete examination of the musculoskeletal system, with
five elements and at least one other system with one ele-
ment, either constitutional, neurological, lymphatic, car-
diac, or skin.  Detailed examination requires 12 elements,
which will require examination of multiple systems to meet
the criteria of 12 elements.  This can be met by five ele-
ments from the musculoskeletal system; five from the neu-
rologic and psychiatric examination; and an additional two
from either the constitutional, skin, cardiovascular, or lym-
phatic systems.  Comprehensive requires complete exami-
nation or performance of all elements and documentation
of every element in each box with a shaded border, and at
least one element in each box with an unshaded border,
which means examination and documentation of two ele-
ments from the constitutional, five elements from the mus-
culoskeletal system examination, one element from the skin
examination, and five elements from the neurologic/psy-
chiatric examination; and at least one element from the pe-
ripheral vascular and lymphatic, which is all elements.

Neurologic Examination:  Specific areas in neurological
examination include:

 - Two elements:
♦ Three of the seven vital signs, and
♦ General appearance.
  - One element:
♦ Ophthalmoscopic examination.

   - Three elements:
♦ Examination of carotid arteries,
♦ Auscultation of the heart, and
♦ Examination of the peripheral/vascular

system.
       - Three elements:

♦ Examination of gait and station,
♦ Muscle strength in upper and lower ex-

tremities, and

Constitutional

Cardiovascular

Neurologic/psychiatric

Musculoskeletal

Constitutional

Eyes

Cardiovascular

Musculoskeletal

Neurological

Lymphatic

Skin
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♦ Muscle tone in upper and lower ex-
tremities.
 - Sixteen elements:

♦ Orientation;
♦ Memory;
♦ Attention span and concentration;
♦ Language;
♦ Knowledge;
♦ Second cranial nerve;
♦ Third, fourth, and sixth cranial nerves;
♦ Fifth cranial nerve;
♦ Seventh cranial nerve;
♦ Eighth cranial nerve;
♦ Ninth cranial nerve;
♦ 11th cranial nerve;
♦ 12th cranial nerve;
♦ Sensation;
♦ Tendon reflexes; and
♦ Test coordination.

Hence, problem focused, which requires one to five ele-
ments, and expanded problem focused, which requires six
elements, are easily met by examination of the neurological
system.  Similarly, a detailed examination (which requires
12 elements) can also be met by examination of the neuro-
logical system alone.  However, a comprehensive examina-
tion should include all elements from systems with shaded
borders, namely constitutional, musculoskeletal, neurologi-
cal, and eyes; and one element from the cardiovascular,
totaling 23 elements.  The major disadvantage of the neu-
rological examination in chronic pain involves ophthalmo-
scopic examination of the optic discs and posterior seg-
ments, and detailed examination of all cranial nerves.  If
ophthalmoscopic examination is not performed, the physi-
cal examination will not meet the criteria for comprehen-
sive.
Differences between musculoskeletal and neurological ex-
amination, along with similarities in comparison to general
multisystem examination, are illustrated in Table 13.

Medical Decision Making

Documentation of the complexity of medical decision mak-
ing involves four types of medical decision making to ac-
commodate all levels of evaluation and management ser-
vices.  Medical decision making refers to the complexity of
establishing a diagnosis and/or selecting a management
option as measured by three components, including:  (1)di-
agnosis/management options, with number of possible di-
agnoses and/or the number of management options; (2)
review of records/investigations, with number and/or com-

plexity of medical records, diagnostic tests, and other in-
formation that must be obtained, reviewed, and analyzed;
and (3) risk(s) of significant complications, morbidity and
mortality, as well as comorbidities associated with the
patient’s presenting problem(s), the diagnostic
procedure(s), and/or the possible management options.

The four types of medical decision-making options in-
clude:

♦ Straightforward,
♦ Low complexity,
♦ Moderate complexity, and
♦ High complexity.

Table 14 shows the progression of elements required for
each level of medical decision making.  To qualify for a
given type of decision making, at least two of the three
elements in the table must be either met or exceeded.

Diagnosis or Management Options

The number of possible diagnoses and/or the number of
management options that must be considered is based on
the number and types of problems addressed during the
encounter, the complexity of establishing a diagnosis, and
management decisions that are made by the physician.
The number and type of diagnostic tests employed may be
an indicator of the number of possible diagnoses.  Prob-
lems that are improving or resolving are less complex than
those that are worsening or failing to change as expected.
The need for further consultations or advice from others is
another indicator of complexity of diagnostic or manage-
ment problems.

Following are some important aspects in documenting di-
agnosis and/or management options.

♦ For each encounter, an assessment, clinical
impression, or diagnosis should be documented.
It may be explicitly stated or implied in documented
decisions regarding management plans and/or
further evaluation.

♦ For a presenting problem with an established
diagnosis, the records should reflect whether the
problem is:

• Improved, well-controlled, resolving, or
resolved;

• Inadequately controlled, worsening, or
failing  to change as expected

♦ For a presenting problem without an established
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diagnosis, the assessment or clinical impression
may be stated in the form of differential diagnosis
or as a possible, probable, or rule-out diagnosis.

♦ The initiation of, or changes in, treatment should
be documented.

♦ The treatment includes a wide range of
mangement options, including patient instruc-
tions, nursing instructions, therapies, and medi-
cations.

♦ If referrals are made, consultations are requested
or advice is sought, they must be indicated on
the record with details as to whom or where the
referral or consultation is made.

Review of Records/Investigations

The nature, amount, and complexity of data to be reviewed
are based on the types of diagnostic testing ordered or
reviewed.  A decision to obtain and review old medical
records and/or obtain history from sources other than the
patient increases the amount and complexity of data to be
reviewed.

Discussion of contradictory or unexpected test results with
the physician who performed or interpreted the tests is an
indication of the complexity of the data being reviewed.  It
is not uncommon for an interventional pain physician to
personally review the images to supplement the reports of
other physicians or include an independent report.  The
following documentation is important:

♦ Whenever a diagnostic service, test, or proce-
dure is ordered, planned, scheduled, or performed
at the time of the encounter, the type of service
should be documented.

♦ The review of investigations including radiology
and/or other diagnostic tests should be docu-
mented.  A simple notation such as, “MRI showed
disc herniation at L5/S1 level,” or “MRI was
grossly within normal limits” is acceptable. Alter-
natively, the review may be documented by ini-
tialing and dating the report containing the test
results.

♦ Documentation should be made with regards to
the decision to obtain old records or additional
history from the family or other sources to supple-
ment that obtained from the patient.

♦ Documentation of relevant findings from the re-
view of the old records, additional history from
the family, or other sources is important; how-
ever, if there is no relevant information beyond

that already obtained, that fact should be docu-
mented.

♦ A notation of old records reviewed or additional
history obtained from the family without elabora-
tion of the facts of what was reviewed and the
result of the review is insufficient.

♦ The results of discussion of radiology or other
diagnostic tests with either the radiologist or
neurologist or any other physician who performed
or interpreted the study should be documented.

♦ The independent interpretation of imaging stud-
ies should be documented.

Risks

The risks of significant complications, morbidity, and/or
mortality are based on the risks associated with:

♦ The presenting problem(s),
♦ The diagnostic procedure(s), and
♦ Possible management options.

Some important aspects of the risks in interventional pain
management are:

♦ Co-morbidity, underlying disease, or other fac-
tors that increase the complexity of medical deci-
sion making by increasing the risk of complica-
tions, morbidity, and/or mortality should be docu-
mented.

♦ Planned or scheduled invasive diagnostic or
therapeutic procedures or surgical procedures at
the time of the encounter should be documented,
with the type of procedure.

♦ If an invasive diagnostic, therapeutic or surgical
procedure is performed at the time of the encoun-
ter, the specific procedure should be documented.

♦ If the patient is referred for an emergency, inva-
sive diagnostic, therapeutic procedure, or surgi-
cal intervention, such referrals should be docu-
mented.

Table 9 shows some salient aspects in the determination of
risks, whether minimal, low, moderate, or high.  However,
the determination of risks is complex and not readily quan-
tifiable, and is also variable with each specialty.  In addi-
tion, the assessment of risk of the presenting problems is
based on the risks related to the disease process antici-
pated between the immediate and the next encounter.  The
assessment of risk of selecting diagnostic procedures and
management options is also based on the risk during and



Pain Physician Vol. 3, No. 3, 2000

Manchikanti • E/M Services 340

immediately following any procedures or treatments.  The
highest level of risk in any one category of the three de-
scribed determines the overall risks.

Counseling and/or Coordination of Care

If either counseling and/or coordination of care domi-
nates the physician/patient and/or family encounter (face-
to-face time in the office or other outpatient setting ex-
ceeding 50% of the time), time is considered the key or
controlling factor to qualify for a particular level of evalu-
ation and management service.  However, if the physician
elects to report the level of service based on counseling
and coordination of care, the total length of time of the
encounter (face-to-face or floor time, as appropriate)
should be documented and the records should describe
the counseling and/or activities.

PROPOSED  NEW  GUIDELINES

The new guidelines proposed in 1998 will soon go for
pilot testing; hence, it is expected that if all goes well,
these guidelines will be implemented in late 2000 or early
2001.  Some of the advantages of the new guidelines are
as follows:

♦ They are presented in a shorter document.
♦ They include new history and examination defi-

nitions and a relaxed set of documentation guide-
lines that may remove some of the “three of the
three” coding requirements for the history and
documentation of new patient encounters.

♦ The history of present illness definitions in-
cludes: the status of one or two “chronic or in-
active conditions,” brief (one to three of eight);
the status of at least three “chronic or inactive
conditions” extended (four plus of eight).

♦ The review-of-systems definitions for extended
and complete history have been significantly re-
duced.

♦ The definition for a complete past, family, and/
or social history has been modified, with at least
one item from any two of the three history areas
instead of three of the three for new patients.

♦ The definition for examinations has been sim-
plified by:

• Eliminating confusing instructions (ex-
ample:  “Perform all elements, shaded
and unshaded boxes”),

• Enhancing clinical flexibility by elimi-

nating rigid distinctions between gen-
eral multisystem versus single-system
examinations, and

• Increasing the level of freedom for phy-
sicians.

♦ Record keeping has been simplified, as new
guidelines state that any type of record format
is acceptable, including simple check lists to in-
dicate.

CONCLUSION

Evaluation and management services are part and parcel
of the practice of interventional pain management.  Con-
sequences of inappropriate coding and insufficient docu-
mentation to support charges billed to Medicare include,
not only penalties, but also exclusion from the Medicare
program, and, finally, prison terms.  Understanding appro-
priate documentation issues of medical necessity and rules
and regulations governing evaluation and management
coding is extremely crucial.  Appropriate documentation
not only will meet the criteria for billing and coding at an
appropriate level, but also will result in higher reimburse-
ment, providing a safety net to avoid fraud and abuse.
This not only complies with the regulations, but also im-
proves patient care.  The new regulations, which may be
released for implementation in late 2000 or early 2001, will
not only clarify a multitude of issues but will also make it
easier for physicians, not only to document appropriate
level of service, but also to do this with less confusion
and fear.
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